
INDIVIDUALS
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Individual Comments



INDIVIDUALS
IND545 – Maury W. Johnson

Individual Comments



INDIVIDUALS
IND545 – Maury W. Johnson

Individual Comments



INDIVIDUALS
IND545 – Maury W. Johnson

Individual Comments



INDIVIDUALS
IND546 – Louisa Gay

Individual Comments

The BLM has received requests for additional public meetings on 
the Mountain Valley Pipeline Project. In lieu of additional public 
meetings, the BLM will be soliciting comments on the Final EIS 
specific to impacts on federal lands.  See response to comment 
FA8-1 regarding Amendment 1.  The remaining comments are 
noted. 

IND546-1



INDIVIDUALS
IND546 – Louisa Gay

Individual Comments



INDIVIDUALS
IND546 – Louisa Gay

Individual Comments



INDIVIDUALS
IND547 – Wilbur and Irene Larew

Individual Comments

See the response to comment FA8-1 regarding Amendment 1.  
See the response to comment FA10-1 regarding Amendments 2 
and 3.

IND547-1



INDIVIDUALS
IND547 – Wilbur and Irene Larew

Individual Comments

See the response to comment FA10-1 regarding Amendment 2.IND547-2

See the response to comment FA10-1 regarding Amendment 3.IND547-3



INDIVIDUALS
IND547 – Wilbur and Irene Larew

Individual Comments

See the response to comment FA10-1 regarding Amendment 4.IND547-4



INDIVIDUALS
IND547 – Wilbur and Irene Larew

Individual Comments

Drinking water resources are discussed in section 4.3 of the EIS. IND547-5

Comments noted.IND547-6

See the response to comment IND2-1 regarding safety. IND547-7



INDIVIDUALS
IND547 – Wilbur and Irene Larew

Individual Comments

See the response to comment FA11-12 regarding need. 
Renewable energy sources and energy efficiency are discussed in 
section 3.0 of the EIS. 

IND547-8



INDIVIDUALS
IND547 – Wilbur and Irene Larew

Individual Comments

Section 4.3.2.1 of the EIS discusses monitoring and testing of 
water wells within 150 feet of the proposed workspaces as well 
as testing of wells and springs within 500 feet of karst areas. 

IND547-9

See the response to comment IND2-3 regarding hydraulic 
fracturing. Climate change, GHGs, and cumulative impacts are 
discussed in section 4.13. 

IND547-10

See the response to comment FA15-5 regarding forest impacts.  
A revised discussion regarding the ANST can be found in section 
4.8 of the EIS. 

IND547-11

Environmental justice is discussed in section 4.9 of the EIS.IND547-12



INDIVIDUALS
IND547 – Wilbur and Irene Larew

Individual Comments



INDIVIDUALS
IND548 – Claudia Neely

Individual Comments

Groundwater and drinking water impacts are discussed in section
4.3 of the EIS. See the response to comment IND3-1 regarding
drinking water testing. Caves are discussed in section 4.1 of the
EIS.

IND548-1

Landslides are addressed in section 4.1 of the EIS.IND548-2

See the response to comment IND209-1 regarding the permanent
fill of wetlands.

IND548-3



INDIVIDUALS
IND548 – Claudia Neely

Individual Comments

Mountain Valley now proposes to cross the Elk, Gauley, and
Greenbrier River using dry-trenching techniques. Tourism is
discussed in section 4.9 of the EIS and recreation is discussed in
section 4.8 of the EIS.

IND548-4



INDIVIDUALS
IND549 – Tina Smusz (on behalf of Mark A. Hileman)

Individual Comments

See the response to comment FA8-1 regarding Amendment 1.  
See the response to comment FA10-1 regarding Amendment 4.

IND549-1



INDIVIDUALS
IND549 – Tina Smusz (on behalf of Mark A. Hileman)

Individual Comments

A revised discussion regarding the ANST can be found in section 
4.8 of the EIS. 

IND549-2

The visual assessment, contained in section 4.8, has been revised.  IND549-3



INDIVIDUALS
IND549 – Tina Smusz (on behalf of Mark A. Hileman)

Individual Comments

Comments noted.IND549-4



INDIVIDUALS
IND550 – Thomas Bouldin

Individual Comments

The EIS addresses socioeconomic issues in section 4.9. Rates
would be analyzed by non-environmental FERC staff. The MVP
pipeline would transport natural gas. Fracking is done during
exploration and production, which is regulated by states, not
FERC.

IND550-1



INDIVIDUALS
IND550 – Thomas Bouldin

Individual Comments



INDIVIDUALS
IND550 – Thomas Bouldin

Individual Comments



INDIVIDUALS
IND550 – Thomas Bouldin

Individual Comments

Impacts on agricultural land is discussed in sections 2, 4.2, and
4.8 of the EIS. Soils are addressed in section 4.2 of the EIS.
Recreation is discussed in section 4.8; tourism in 4.9.

IND550-2



INDIVIDUALS
IND550 – Thomas Bouldin

Individual Comments



INDIVIDUALS
IND550 – Thomas Bouldin

Individual Comments

Short-term employment is discussed in section 4.9 of the EIS.
The environmental justice analysis provided in section 4.9 of the
EIS is consistent with EO 12898.

IND550-3



INDIVIDUALS
IND550 – Thomas Bouldin

Individual Comments



INDIVIDUALS
IND550 – Thomas Bouldin

Individual Comments

Alternatives are discussed provided in section 3. Climate change
is evaluated in sections 4.11 and 4.13 of the EIS.

IND550-4



INDIVIDUALS
IND550 – Thomas Bouldin

Individual Comments

The FERC does not regulate the exploration or production of
natural gas; that is the purview of individual states (see section
1.3 of the EIS). The FERC would not revise or supplement the
draft EIS, but would produce a final EIS that addresses comments
on the draft.

IND550-5



INDIVIDUALS
IND550 – Thomas Bouldin

Individual Comments



INDIVIDUALS
IND550 – Thomas Bouldin

Individual Comments



INDIVIDUALS
IND550 – Thomas Bouldin

Individual Comments



INDIVIDUALS
IND551 – Tina Smusz (on behalf of Vicki Tolbert)

Individual Comments

See the response to comment FA8-1 regarding Amendment 1.  
The opposition to the LRMP amendments is noted. 

IND551-1



INDIVIDUALS
IND552 – Chris Hazynski

Individual Comments

Water resources are discussed in section 4.3 of the EIS. IND552-1



INDIVIDUALS
IND553 – Pat Chlepas (on behalf of Constantine Chlepas)

Individual Comments

See the response to comment FA8-1 regarding Amendment 1.  
The opposition to the LRMP amendments is noted.

IND553-1

See the response to comment FA10-1 regarding Amendment 2.IND553-2



INDIVIDUALS
IND553 – Pat Chlepas (on behalf of Constantine Chlepas)

Individual Comments

See the response to comment FA10-1 regarding Amendment 3.IND553-3

See the response to comment FA10-1 regarding Amendment 4.IND553-4

See the response to CO34-1 regarding hydrogeologic studies.IND553-5



INDIVIDUALS
IND554 – Tina Smusz (on behalf of Debora Warren)

Individual Comments

See the response to comment FA8-1 regarding Amendment 1.  
The opposition to the LRMP amendments is noted. 

IND554-1



INDIVIDUALS
IND555 – Tina Smusz (on behalf of Therese B. Lundberg)

Individual Comments

See the response to comment FA8-1 regarding Amendment 1. 
The opposition to the LRMP amendments is noted. 

IND555-1



INDIVIDUALS
IND556 – Barbara Coe

Individual Comments

See the response to comment IND270-1 regarding wildlife. The
ANST is discussed in section 4.8 of the EIS. Forest
fragmentation is discussed in section 4.4. Water resources are
addressed in section 4.3 of the EIS.

IND556-1



INDIVIDUALS
IND557 – Lauren Krouse

Individual Comments

The Commission would decide about public interest in their
Project Order. Safety is discussed in section 4.12 of the final
EIS. Water resources are addressed in section 4.3; forest in 4.4;
threatened and endangered species in 4.7; historic resources in
section 4.10; tourism and employment in 4.9. The ANST is
discussed in section 4.8 of the EIS.

IND557-1



INDIVIDUALS
IND558 – Jaqueline Lucki

Individual Comments

Water resources and wetlands are discussed in section 4.3 of the
final EIS; wildlife in 4.5; visual resources in 4.8. Benefits are
mentioned in section 4.9. See the response to comment FA11-12
regarding need. See the response to IND2-3 regarding export.

IND558-1



INDIVIDUALS
IND559 – Susan Thames

Individual Comments

Landslides are addressed in section 4.2 of the EIS. Wildlife is
discussed is addressed in section 4.5. Tourism is discussed in
section 4.9 of the EIS. A highway alternative is examined in
section 3. Underground, FERC-regulated welded steel natural
gas transportation pipelines rarely leak.

IND559-1



INDIVIDUALS
IND560 – Rosemary Goss

Individual Comments

See the response to comment CO6-1 regarding the Mount Tabor
Variation.

IND560-1



INDIVIDUALS
IND560 – Rosemary Goss

Individual Comments



INDIVIDUALS
IND561 – Nan Gray

Individual Comments

IND561-1

The DOT regulations determine class pipeline thickness and
shutoff valves. The potential for pipeline leakage is discussed in
section 4.12.

IND561-2

Springs, water resources, and wetlands are discussed in section
4.3 of the EIS. Sinkholes are addressed in section 4.1 of the EIS.
The No Action Alternative is discussed in section 3.



INDIVIDUALS
IND562 – Steven Powers

Individual Comments

See the response to comment CO107-26 regarding the Roanoke
logperch.

IND562-1

See the response to comment FA11-15 regarding turbidity and
sedimentation. See the response to IND70-1 regarding erosion.
See the response to comment CO107-26 regarding the Roanoke
logperch.

IND562-2



INDIVIDUALS
IND562 – Steven Powers

Individual Comments

See the response to comment CO107-26 regarding the Roanoke
logperch.

IND562-3



INDIVIDUALS
IND563 – Kevin Klesenski

Individual Comments

Crossing of the ANST, including a visual analysis, are discussed
in section 4.8 of the EIS.

IND563-1



INDIVIDUALS
IND564 – Regina Lorenzen

Individual Comments

See the response to comment CO2-1 regarding benefits. See the
response to comment IND2-1 regarding safety.

IND564-1

Water resources are discussed in section 4.3 of the EIS. See the
response to comment IND3-1 regarding drinking water.

IND564-2

See the response to comment CO14-3 regarding spills. See the
response to comment IND2-1 regarding safety.

IND564-3

See the response to comment IND401-5 regarding pending water
wells. As stated in section 2.7 of the EIS, the useful life of the
projects is expected to be about 50 years.

IND564-4

See the response to comment FA11-15 regarding open-cut wet
waterbody crossings.

IND564-5

See the response to comment IND184-1 regarding easements and
compensation.

IND564-6



INDIVIDUALS
IND564 – Regina Lorenzen

Individual Comments

The EIS provides a discussion of soils in section 4.2 and water
resources in section 4.3.

IND564-7

See the response to comment IND12-1 regarding property values.IND564-8

Water resources are addressed in section 4.3 of the EIS.IND564-9

See the response to comment IND2-3 regarding export.IND564-10



INDIVIDUALS
IND565 – Susan Cleaver

Individual Comments

This EIS is for the Mountain Valley Project, not ACP.IND565-1

Air quality is discussed in section 4.11.1 of the EIS.IND565-2

See the response to comment IND2-1 regarding safety.IND565-3

Property values, mortgages, and tourism are discussed in section
4.9 of the EIS.

IND565-4

See the response to comment IND2-3 regarding hydraulic
fracturing.

IND565-5

Renewable energy alternatives are discussed in section 3 of the
EIS. See also the response to comment IND40-1 regarding
renewable energy. See the response to comment FA11-12
regarding need.

IND565-6



INDIVIDUALS
IND566 – Pris Sears

Individual Comments

The ANST and Jefferson National Forest are discussed in section
4.8 of the EIS. Citizens would not be displaced from their
communities.

IND566-1



INDIVIDUALS
IND567 – John Strong

Individual Comments

See the response to comment FA11-15 regarding open-cut wet
waterbody crossings. If Mountain Valley crosses all waterbodies
using dry techniques, there would be a low potential for
downstream sedimentation and turbidity

IND567-1

See the response to comment IND209-1 regarding the permanent
fill of wetlands.

IND567-2

See the response to comment IND226-17 regarding water wells
and blasting.

IND567-3

See the response to comment FA11-15 regarding sedimentation
and turbidity at waterbody crossings.

IND567-4

Karst is addressed in section 4.1 of the EIS.IND567-5

Route adjustments received after issuance of the draft EIS are
discussed in the final EIS. Landslides are addressed in section
4.2 of the EIS.

IND567-6



INDIVIDUALS
IND568 – Nicola Tilley

Individual Comments

Water resources are addressed in section 4.3 of the EIS.IND568-1

See the response to comment IND401-5 regarding pending water
wells. See the response to comment IND226-17 regarding water
wells and blasting.

IND568-2



INDIVIDUALS
IND569 – Benjamin Upton

Individual Comments

The proposed pipelines would transport natural gas, not oil. See
the response to CO14-3 regarding spills. The ANST is discussed
in section 4.8 of the EIS. The right-of-way would be restored
and revegetated following construction (see section 2.4.2 of the
EIS).

IND569-1



INDIVIDUALS
IND570 – Tara Dunderdale

Individual Comments

The EIS concluded that impacts on most environmental resources
(except the clearing of forest) would be short-term and not
significant. Water resources are discussed in section 4.3 of the
EIS.

IND570-1



INDIVIDUALS
IND571 – Josh Moore

Individual Comments

Alternative routes using existing rights-of-way was addressed in
section 3 of the EIS.

IND571-1

Visual impacts are addressed in revisions to section 4.8 of the
EIS. Tourism is discussed in section 4.9 of the EIS. See also the
response to comment IND191-3 regarding local jobs.

IND571-2

The ANST is discussed in section 4.8 of the EIS.IND571-3



INDIVIDUALS
IND572 – Alyssa Fowers

Individual Comments

The EIS provides a discussion of the ANST in section 4.8 and
seismic activity in section 4.1. Water resources are discussed in
section 4.3 of the EIS.

IND572-1

See the response to comments FA8-1 and FA10-1 regarding the
Jefferson National Forest LRMP amendments.

IND572-2

See the response to comment FA11-12 regarding need. Tourism
is discussed in section 4.9 of the EIS.

IND572-3



INDIVIDUALS
IND573 – Kevin Goth

Individual Comments

Stream crossings are addressed in section 4.3 of the EIS.
Recreation is addressed in section 4.8 while tourism is addressed
in section 4.9 of the EIS.

IND573-1



INDIVIDUALS
IND574 – Joseph Roberts

Individual Comments

Comments noted. The Boones Mill Christian Church would be
about 500 feet from the proposed pipeline. Given the distance
from the proposed pipeline, impacts to the church’s property are
not expected.

IND574-1

See the response to comment IND2-1 regarding safety. See the
response to comment IND3-1 regarding drinking water.

IND574-2



INDIVIDUALS
IND575 – Gordon P. Engelbrecht

Individual Comments

The Greater Newport Rural Historic District is discussed in
section 4.10 of the EIS.

IND575-1

See the response to comment FA11-2 and LA5-1 regarding 
preparation of the EIS.  The EIS provides a discussion of water 
resources in section 4.3, karst in section 4.1, soils in section 4.2, 
steep slopes in section 4.1, and timber in section 4.4.  

IND575-2

See comment CO16-1 regarding FERC decision process.IND575-3



INDIVIDUALS
IND575 – Gordon P. Engelbrecht

Individual Comments

The BLM has received requests for additional public meetings on
the Mountain Valley Pipeline Project. In lieu of additional public
meetings, the BLM will be soliciting comments on the final EIS
specific to impacts on federal lands.

IND575-4

See the response to FA8-2 regarding the Hybrid 1A alternative.IND575-5



INDIVIDUALS
IND576 – Matt Kearns

Individual Comments

The EIS addresses the ANST and Jefferson National Forest in
section 4.8.

IND576-1

See the response to comment IND3-1 regarding eminent domain.
See the response to comment CO2-1 regarding benefits. See the
response to comment IND2-3 regarding export.

IND576-2



INDIVIDUALS
IND577 – Logan Bockrath

Individual Comments

A revised discussion of flash flooding is provided in section 4.3.2
of the final EIS. See the response to comment CO14-3 regarding
spills. See the response to comment FA11-15 regarding open-cut
wet waterbody crossings. Since Mountain Valley would cross all
waterbodies using dry techniques, there would be a low potential
for downstream sedimentation and turbidity.

IND577-1

See the response to comment IND209-1 regarding the permanent
fill of wetlands.

IND577-2

See the response to comment LA13-16 regarding water wells and
springs. See the response to comment CO14-1 regarding
blasting.

IND577-3

See the response to comment FA11-15 regarding sedimentation
and turbidity.

IND577-4

An updated discussion of karst is provided in section 4.1 of the
EIS. See the response to comment LA1-4 regarding existing 42-
inch-diameter natural gas pipelines in karst terrain.

IND577-5



INDIVIDUALS
IND577 – Logan Bockrath

Individual Comments

See the response to IND177-1 regarding landslides and Mountain
Valley’s revised Landslide Mitigation Plan.

IND577-6



INDIVIDUALS
IND578 – Lawrence M. Beyer

Individual Comments

Comments noted.IND578-1



INDIVIDUALS
IND578 – Lawrence M. Beyer

Individual Comments



INDIVIDUALS
IND579 – Bob Peckman

Individual Comments

See the response to comment IND1-3 regarding eminent domain.
See the response to comment IND2-3 regarding export.

IND579-1

See the response to comment IND2-3 regarding hydraulic
fracturing.

IND579-2

Karst is addressed in section 4.1 of the EIS. See the response to
comment IND2-1 regarding safety.

IND579-3



INDIVIDUALS
IND580 – H. Randell Grumpelt, Ph. D

Individual Comments

See the response to comment CO2-1 regarding benefits. See the
response to comment FA11-12 regarding need.

IND580-1



INDIVIDUALS
IND581 – Jennifer S. Baker

Individual Comments

See the response to comment FA11-15 regarding open-cut wet
waterbody crossings. Since Mountain Valley would cross all
waterbodies using dry techniques, there would be a low potential
for downstream sedimentation and turbidity.

IND581-1

See the response to comment LA15-14 regarding water wells and
blasting.

IND581-2



INDIVIDUALS
IND582 – Randall L. Thomas

Individual Comments

See the response to comment FA11-15 regarding open-cut wet
waterbody crossings. Since Mountain Valley would cross all
waterbodies using dry techniques, there would be a low potential
for downstream sedimentation and turbidity.

IND582-1



INDIVIDUALS
IND583 – Marcia Rucker

Individual Comments

Renewable energy alternatives are discussed in section 3 of the
EIS. See also the response to comment IND40-1 regarding
renewable energy.

IND583-1

The EIS provides a discussion of impacts and mitigation
measures for vegetation in section 4.4, wildlife in section 4.5,
agricultural in section 4.8, and water resources in section 4.3.

IND583-2

The commenter's statements are noted. As stated in section 2.7
of the EIS, the useful life of the projects is expected to be about
50 years. Socioeconomics is discussed in section 4.9 of the EIS.

IND583-3



INDIVIDUALS
IND584 – Individual

Individual Comments

The EIS provides a discussion of karst in section 4.1, water
resources in section 4.1, landslides in section 4.1. The No Action
Alternative is discussed in section 3.

IND584-1



INDIVIDUALS
IND585 – Margaret Roston

Individual Comments

See the response to comment LA15-5 regarding changes to the
proposed MVP. No compressor station is proposed in Virginia.

IND585-1



INDIVIDUALS
IND586 – Robert M. Jarrell

Individual Comments

See the response to comment CO2-1 regarding benefits. See the
response to comment FA11-12 regarding need. See the response
to comment IND1-3 regarding eminent domain. See the response
to comment IND134-1 regarding negotiations with landowners.

IND586-1



INDIVIDUALS
IND586 – Robert M. Jarrell

Individual Comments

Landslides are addressed in section 4.1 of the EIS. See the
response to comment IND70-1 regarding erosion. A revised
discussion of flash flooding is provided in section 4.3.2 of the
final EIS.

IND586-2

Section 3 of the EIS discusses how Mountain Valley selected its
route. Safety is addressed in section 4.12. If the Commission
authorizes the project, FERC staff would monitor construction
and restoration.

IND586-3



INDIVIDUALS
IND587 – Margaret Roston

Individual Comments

The BLM has received requests for additional public meetings on
the Mountain Valley Pipeline Project. In lieu of additional public
meetings, the BLM will be soliciting comments on the final EIS
specific to impacts on federal lands.

IND587-1

See the response to comment LA2-1 regarding the draft EIS
public comment sessions. Filings are kept within the FERC e-
Library system. Written comments are equally considered with
verbal comments. The nominal construction right-of-way for the
pipeline is 125-feet-wide. The final EIS addresses the minor
route modifications made by Mountain Valley in October 2016.

IND587-2



INDIVIDUALS
IND587 – Margaret Roston

Individual Comments



INDIVIDUALS
IND588 – Elise Keaton

Individual Comments

Section 4.10 of the final EIS discusses archaeological sites
identified in the APE. As upheld by the courts, the FERC does
not have to make final determinations of NRHP eligibility and
project effects on historic properties at the NEPA stage.

IND588-1



INDIVIDUALS
IND589 – Dollie Wright and Tonya Shackelford

Individual Comments

Open spaces would not be ruined by the MVP. After the pipeline
is installed, and the right-of-way restored and revegetated,
kayaking, fishing, snow skiing and hiking could resume.

IND589-1



INDIVIDUALS
IND590 – Charlotte Thomas

Individual Comments

See the response to comment IND3-1 regarding drinking water.
See the response to comment IND1-3 regarding eminent domain.

IND590-1



INDIVIDUALS
IND591 – Simone Poirie-Bures and Allen Bures

Individual Comments

The project area is not pristine. It contains existing
infrastructure, such as roads, pipelines, powerlines, towns,
housing developments, farmsteads, schools and churches, and
commercial structures. Visual resources are discussed in section
4.8 of the EIS.

IND591-1

See the response to comment IND92-1 regarding leaks.IND591-2

Renewable energy alternatives are discussed in section 3 of the
EIS. See also the response to comment IND40-1 regarding
renewable energy.

IND591-3

We conclude that with mitigation, the project is not likely to have
significant impacts on most environmental resources (except
forest). The right-of-way would be restored and revegetated
following construction (see section 2.4.2 of the EIS).

IND591-4



INDIVIDUALS
IND592 – Darlene Cunningham

Individual Comments

We address comments on the draft EIS in this finalIND592-1

See the response to comment FA11-12 regarding need. IND592-2

See the response to comment LA1-4 regarding existing 42-inch-
diameter pipelines in karst terrain. See the response to comment
IND62-1 regarding Dr. Kastning’s report.

IND592-3

The opposition to the LRMP amendments is noted.IND592-4

Climate change is addressed in sections 4.11 and 4.13 of the EISIND592-5

Historic Districts are discussed in section 4.10 of the EIS.
Impacts on historic properties can be mitigated, as specified in 36
CFR 800, the regulations for implement Section 106 of the
NHPA.

IND592-6



INDIVIDUALS
IND592 – Darlene Cunningham

Individual Comments

See the response to comment FA11-2 and LA5-1 regarding
preparation of the EIS.

IND592-7



INDIVIDUALS
IND593 – Margaret Roston

Individual Comments

Comments notedIND593-1

See the response to comment IND70-1 regarding erosion.IND593-2

See the response to comment IND288-3 regarding road repairsIND593-3

Tourism is addressed in section 4.9 of the EIS.IND593-4

Construction traffic is addressed in section 4.9.2 of the EIS. As
stated in section 4.9.2 of the EIS, construction activities would be
scheduled to take advantage of daylight hours and, as such,
construction crews would typically avoid peak commuting
periods by traveling to the worksite early in the morning and
from the worksite later in the evening.

IND593-5

The comment is noted. The FS has worked with Mountain Valley
to develop project design features, mitigation measures and
monitoring procedures to minimize the impacts to the resources
on NFS lands. These mitigation measures and monitoring
procedures are described in the POD.
.

IND593-6

See the response to comment LA1-7 regarding herbicides.IND593-7

See the response to comment CO14-3 regarding spills.IND593-8

See the response to comment IND3-1 regarding drinking water.
As stated in section 4.3.2 of the EIS, hydrostatic testing water
would be tested prior to discharge.

IND593-9

See the response to comment IND70-1 regarding erosion. A
revised discussion of flash flooding is provided in section 4.3.2
of the final EIS.

IND593-10



INDIVIDUALS
IND593 – Margaret Roston

Individual Comments

Timing windows are discussed in section 4.5 and 4.6 of the EISIND593-11

Section 2.7 of the EIS provides an overview of future plans and
abandonment.

IND593-12

See the response to comment IND12-1 regarding property values.IND593-13

See the response to comment CO14-1 regarding blastingIND593-14

See the response to comment IND28-3 regarding financial
responsibility.

IND593-15

See the response to comment LA15-5 regarding changes to the
proposed MVP.

IND593-16



INDIVIDUALS
IND593 – Margaret Roston

Individual Comments



INDIVIDUALS
IND594 – Robert Stanley

Individual Comments

The proposed pipelines would transport natural gas not oil. See
the response to comment IND3-1 regarding drinking water. We
conclude that with mitigation, the project is not likely to have
significant impacts on most environmental resources (except
forest). The right-of-way would be restored and revegetated
following construction (see section 2.4.2 of the EIS).

IND594-1



INDIVIDUALS
IND595 – Elise Keaton

Individual Comments

Section 4.10 of the final EIS discusses archaeological sites in the
APE; including those recorded near Pence Springs.

IND595-1



INDIVIDUALS
IND595 – Elise Keaton

Individual Comments



INDIVIDUALS
IND596 – Individual

Individual Comments

See the response to comment LA15-14 regarding water wells and
blasting.

IND596-1



INDIVIDUALS
IND597 – Willa Izzo

Individual Comments

See the response to comment LA15-2 regarding karst. Dye trace
studies which may illustrate groundwater connections between
caves conducted after the draft EIS are discussed in this final.

IND597-1



INDIVIDUALS
IND598 – Pat Curran Leonard

Individual Comments

See the response to comment LA15-14 regarding water wells.IND598-1



INDIVIDUALS
IND599 – Willa Izzo

Individual Comments

See the response to comment IND209-1 regarding the permanent
fill of wetlands.

IND599-1



INDIVIDUALS
IND600 – Daniel Angle

Individual Comments

The pipeline routing on the subject property is discussed in
section 3.5 of the final EIS.

IND600-1

Four archaeological sites (44FR398, 399, 400, and 404) were
recorded by Mountain Valley’s contractor during surveys of the
APE on Mr. Angle’s property. All four sites were evaluated as
being not eligible for the NRHP.

IND600-2

See the response to comment IND12-1 regarding property values.IND600-3

See the response to comment FA11-12 regarding need.IND600-4



See the response to comment LA15-5 regarding changes to the
proposed MVP. Actions under a Blanket are still reviewed by
FERC staff.

INDIVIDUALS
IND601 – Allyn M. Moss

Individual Comments

IND601-1

See the response to comment FA8-1 regarding the 500-foot-wide
utility corridor in the Jefferson National Forest.

IND601-2

The EIS provides a discussion of air quality in section 4.11.1,
water in section 4.3, soils in section 4.2, threatened and
endangered species in section 4.7, and forests in section 4.4.

IND601-3



The MVP would not be located within Pocahontas County, West
Virginia. Karst is discussed in section 4.1 of the EIS. FERC-
regulated buried welded steel natural gas transportation pipelines
rarely leak. In such an unlikely event, natural gas is lighter than
air and would dissipate into the atmosphere; so there would be no
contamination of groundwater. See the response to comment
LA1-4 regarding existing 42-inch-diamter pipelines in karst
terrain.

INDIVIDUALS
IND602 – Christine Smith

Individual Comments

IND602-1



See the response to comment IND18-2 regarding emergency
response.

INDIVIDUALS
IND603 – Pamela Humphrey

Individual Comments

IND603-1



The locations depicted on the commentor’s map are noted

INDIVIDUALS
IND604 – Nan Gray

Individual Comments

IND604-1



Climate change is addressed in sections 4.11 and 4.13 of the EIS.
Renewable energy alternatives are discussed in section 3 of the
EIS. See also the response to comment IND40-1 regarding
renewable energy.

INDIVIDUALS
IND605 – Pat Churchman

Individual Comments

IND605-1



If the American chestnut trees are more than 500 feet away from
the pipeline, it is not likely they would be affected by the MVP.

INDIVIDUALS
IND606 – Linda Emrich

Individual Comments

IND606-1

Topsoil is discussed in sections 2, 4.2, and 4.8 of the EIS.
Climate change is addressed in section 4.13 of the EIS.

IND606-2



The project area is not pristine. It contains existing
infrastructure, including highways, pipelines, powerlines, towns,
housing subdivisions, farmsteads, churches and schools, and
commercial buildings. Safety is discussed in section 4.12 of the
EIS. See the response to comment IND28-3 regarding financial
responsibility.

INDIVIDUALS
IND606 – Linda Emrich

Individual Comments

IND606-3

GHG are discussed in sections 4.11 and 4.13.IND606-4

As discussed in section 4.1, the MVP pipeline is routed across
some coal mines.

IND606-5

We conclude that with mitigation, the project is not likely to have
significant impacts on most environmental resources (except
forest). See the response to comment IND2-3 regarding hydraulic
fracturing.

IND606-6



See the response to comment IND3-1 regarding drinking water.

INDIVIDUALS
IND607 – Christina Lewencruk

Individual Comments

IND607-1



See the response to IND177-1 regarding landslides and Mountain
Valley’s revised Landslide Mitigation Plan.

INDIVIDUALS
IND608 – Individual

Individual Comments

IND608-1



See the response to comment LA2-1 regarding the draft EIS
comment sessions. See the recommendation for complaint
resolution procedures as discussed in section 4.8.2 of the EIS.
See also the response to comment LA14-9 regarding the FERC’s
dispute resolution service.

INDIVIDUALS
IND609 – Pat Curran Leonard

Individual Comments

IND609-1



The locations depicted on the commentor’s map are noted.

INDIVIDUALS
IND610 – Nan Gray

Individual Comments

IND610-1



Tourism is addressed in section 4.9 of the EIS

INDIVIDUALS
IND611 – Lauren Wadsworth

Individual Comments

IND611-1

A revised discussion of flash flooding is provided in section 4.3.2 
of the final EIS.  See the response to comment IND12-1 
regarding property values. 

IND611-2

See the response to comment IND288-3 regarding road repairs.  
Appendix E provides a list of access road improvements to insure 
safe transport during construction. 

IND611-3



Socioeconomics are addressed in section 4.9 of the EIS.

INDIVIDUALS
IND612 - JBF

Individual Comments

IND612-1



Section 4.3.1 of the EIS states that construction of the proposed
MVP could also result in minor fluctuations in groundwater
levels. However, groundwater flow is typically significantly
deeper than the proposed trench depth of 10 feet, which would be
refilled, and graded to original contours during restoration.
Groundwater levels would not be significantly affected by project
construction.

INDIVIDUALS
IND613 – Robert J. Gronan

Individual Comments

IND613-1



See the response to comment IND374-3 regarding monitoring
distances for drinking water sources.

INDIVIDUALS
IND613 – Robert J. Gronan

Individual Comments

IND613-2

The draft EIS would not be re-issued, but FERC produced a final
EIS that addresses comments on the draft.

IND613-3



Seismicity is discussed in section 4.1 of the EIS. Tourism is
discussed in section 4.9 of the EIS. See the response to comment
IND3-1 regarding drinking water.

INDIVIDUALS
IND614 – Lorin Salem

Individual Comments

IND614-1

Socioeconomics is discussed in section 4.9 of the EIS.IND614-2

The Roadless Area Conservation Rule and impacts to roadless
areas under this regulation are discussed in section 4.8 of the EIS.

IND614-3

We conclude that with mitigation, the project is not likely to have
significant impacts on most environmental resources (except
forest).

IND614-4



Comments noted.

INDIVIDUALS
IND615 – David and Teresa Ehrlich

Individual Comments

IND615-1

The EIS took into consideration comments from the public,
including reports submitted by outside parties who claimed to be
academics or professional scholars. The EIS provides a
discussion of sinkholes in section 4.1, water resources in section
4.3, and safety in section 4.12. See the response to comment
IND2-1 regarding safety. See the response to comment IND3-1
regarding drinking water. See the response to comment IND92-1
regarding leaks.

IND615-2

NEPA does not require that need be demonstrated in an EIS. See
the response to comment FA11-12 regarding need. The EIS
indicates that the MVP would not cause irreparable harm to the
environment of Virginia; most effects on resources (except
forest) would be temporary or short-term.

IND615-3



As stated in section 4.1 of the EIS, maintained pipelines
constructed using modern arc-welding techniques have
performed well in seismically active areas of the United States,
such as California. A review of gas transmission line
performance after a 1994 seismic event in Northridge showed
that 91 percent of all pipeline damage occurred in areas with
earthquakes of MII greater than or equal to VIII (O’Rourke and
Palmer, 1994b). Only large, abrupt ground displacements have
caused serious impacts on pipeline facilities.

INDIVIDUALS
IND616 – Margaret A. Roston

Individual Comments

IND616-1

A revised discussion of flash flooding is provided in section 4.3.2
of the final EIS. Karst is discussed in section 4.1 of the EIS.

IND616-2

See the response to comment FA11-12 regarding need. See the
response to comment IND3-1 regarding drinking water. See the
response to comment CO2-1 regarding benefits. See the
response to comment IND2-1 regarding safety. See the response
to comment IND2-3 regarding hydraulic fracturing. See the
response to comment IND28-3 regarding financial responsibility.

IND616-3

See the response to comment IND2-3 regarding hydraulic
fracturing.

IND616-4



The comment is noted. The FS has worked with Mountain Valley 
to develop project design features, mitigation measures and 
monitoring procedures to minimize the impacts to the resources 
on NFS lands. These mitigation measures and monitoring 
procedures are described in the POD.

INDIVIDUALS
IND617 – Dianne Broussard

Individual Comments

IND617-1



INDIVIDUALS
IND617 – Dianne Broussard

Individual Comments



As explained in section 1.2 of our final EIS, the Commission
would decide if the economic benefits outweigh the
environmental costs of the MVP in its Project Order. Visual
impacts on the Jefferson National Forest and ANST are discussed
in section 4.8. Steep slopes are addressed in section 4.1 of the
EIS.

INDIVIDUALS
IND618 – Andrew Schenker

Individual Comments

IND618-1



Section 4.12 has been revised to provide a citation for that
statement. Section 4.12 provides fatalities for the public and
pipeline workers. The nature of the injuries is not available. The
response to comment IND138-1 regarding setback distances.

INDIVIDUALS
IND619 – Robert Pierson

Individual Comments

IND619-1



Section 2.7 of the EIS provides an overview of future plans and
abandonment.

INDIVIDUALS
IND620 – Robert Pierson

Individual Comments

IND620-1



INDIVIDUALS
IND620 – Robert Pierson

Individual Comments



As stated on page ES-2 of the EIS, “We,” “us,” and “our” refer to
the environmental staff of the FERC’s Office of Energy Projects.
See the response to comment IND152-1 regarding the FERC’s
third-party monitoring program.

INDIVIDUALS
IND621 – Pat Curran Leonard

Individual Comments

IND621-1



The projects would be constructed in accordance with federal and
state regulations. Oversight would be the responsibility of the
federal DOT program.

INDIVIDUALS
IND622 – Pat Curran Leonard

Individual Comments

IND622-1



The comment is noted. The FS has worked with MVP to develop 
project design features, mitigation measures and monitoring 
procedures to minimize the impacts to the resources on NFS 
lands. These mitigation measures and monitoring procedures are 
described in the POD.

INDIVIDUALS
IND623 – Raymond Groves

Individual Comments

IND623-1

See the response to comment FA11-12 regarding need. We
conclude that with mitigation, the project is not likely to have
significant impacts on most environmental resources (except
forest).

IND623-2

Karst is addressed in section 4.1 of the EIS. See the response to
comment LA1-4 regarding existing 42-inch-diameter pipelines in
karst terrain.

IND623-3

Historic resources are addressed in section 4.10 of the EIS.
Impacts on historic properties can be mitigated, in accordance
with 36 CFR 800, the regulations for implementing Section 106
of the NHPA.

IND623-5

The Commission would decide whether or not to authorized the
projects.

IND623-7

Climate change is discussed in sections 4.11 and 4.13 of the EIS.IND623-4

See the response to comment IND12-1 regarding property values.
Tourism is addressed in section 4.9 of the EIS.

IND623-6



The environmental surveys referenced in the EIS are not
inaccurate.

INDIVIDUALS
IND624 – Elizabeth F. Thomas

Individual Comments

IND624-1

See the response to comment IND2-3 regarding hydraulic
fracturing and export. See the response to comment CO2-1
regarding benefits. See the response to comment IND70-1
regarding erosion.

IND624-2

Karst and steep slopes are addressed in section 4.1 of the EIS.
See the response to comment IND3-1 regarding drinking water.
See the response to comment CO14-1 regarding blasting. See the
response to comment CO14-3 regarding spills. See the response
to comment IND277-11 regarding chemicals.

IND624-3

Earthquakes are addressed in section 4.1 of the EIS.IND624-4



Karst is addressed in section 4.1 of the EIS. Renewable energy
alternatives are discussed in section 3 of the EIS. See also the
response to comment IND40-1 regarding renewable energy.

INDIVIDUALS
IND625 – Lauren Cooper

Individual Comments

IND625-1



See the response to comment FA11-12 regarding need.
Alternatives are discussed in section 3 of the EIS. See the
response to comment IND1-3 regarding eminent domain.

INDIVIDUALS
IND626 – Keith Wilson

Individual Comments

IND626-1

See the response to comment FA11-2 and LA5-1 regarding
preparation of the EIS. See the response to comment IND196-2
regarding prior to construction recommendations.

IND626-2



See also the response to comment FA15-10 regarding lifecycle
emissions. Fugitive emissions are addressed in section 4.11.1 of
the EIS. See the response to comment IND2-3 regarding
hydraulic fracturing.

INDIVIDUALS
IND626 – Keith Wilson

Individual Comments

IND626-3

See the response to comment IND2-3 regarding hydraulic
fracturing. Section 4.13 provides an assessment of gas wells to
the extent that information is available.

IND626-4

See the response to comment FA11-12 regarding need. See the
response to comment IND1-3 regarding eminent domain. See the
response to comment IND2-3 regarding export.

IND626-5



Labellevue Drive would be used as a temporary access road and
restored following construction. The statements regarding use of
the access road are noted. As stated in section 4.8 of the EIS,
Mountain Valley expects a maximum of about 45 vehicle trips
from each yard between 7:30 am and 8:30 am, with return trips
from the right-of-way between 4:30 pm and 6:00 pm.

INDIVIDUALS
IND626 – Keith Wilson

Individual Comments

IND626-6

See the response to comment IND3-1 regarding drinking water.IND626-7

Section 3.5 has been revised to provide a discussion of the
Labellevue Drive access road.

IND626-8



The statements regarding use of the property during construction
are noted.

INDIVIDUALS
IND626 – Keith Wilson

Individual Comments

IND626-9

See the response to comment IND3-1 regarding drinking water.
As Labellevue Drive is an existing road, the well should not have
to be relocated.

IND626-10

As stated in section 2.4.2 of the EIS, construction would
generally proceed in an assembly line fashion with construction
crews moving down the construction right-of-way as work
progresses. Construction and restoration at any particular point
along the pipeline route would take about 3 weeks to complete;
although progress could be delayed by topography, weather, or
other factors.

IND626-11



The landowner is encouraged to negotiate changes to Mountain
Valley’s easement agreement directly with Mountain Valley.

INDIVIDUALS
IND626 – Keith Wilson

Individual Comments

IND626-12



INDIVIDUALS
IND626 – Keith Wilson

Individual Comments



See the response to comment FA11-15 regarding open-cut wet
waterbody crossings. A revised discussion of sedimentation and
turbidity can be found in section 4.3 of the final EIS.

INDIVIDUALS
IND627 – Elise Keaton

Individual Comments

IND627-1



See the response to comment FA11-2 and LA5-1 regarding
preparation of the EIS. See the response to comment FA8-1
regarding the 500-foot-wide utility corridor in the Jefferson
National Forest.

INDIVIDUALS
IND628 – Dr. Elizabeth C. Fine

Individual Comments

IND628-1

Renewable energy alternatives are discussed in section 3 of the
EIS. See also the response to comment IND40-1 regarding
renewable energy.

IND628-2

See the response to comment IND2-3 regarding hydraulic
fracturing.

IND628-3



INDIVIDUALS
IND628 – Dr. Elizabeth C. Fine

Individual Comments

See the response to comment FA10-1 regarding Amendments 2 
and 4.

IND628-4

See the response to comment FA11-12 regarding need. Section
3.3 of the EIS provided a discussion of using existing pipelines as
alternatives.

IND628-5

See the response to comment IND62-1 regarding Dr. Kastning’s
report.

IND628-6



Comments noted. Impacts on the Jefferson National Forest,
BRP, and ANST are discussed in section 4.8 of the EIS.

INDIVIDUALS
IND628 – Dr. Elizabeth C. Fine

Individual Comments

IND628-7



See the response to comment FA8-1 regarding the 500-foot-wide
utility corridor in the Jefferson National Forest.

INDIVIDUALS
IND629 – Georgia Haverty

Individual Comments

IND629-1



See the response to comment IND70-1 regarding erosion. See
the response to comment IND152-1 regarding third-party
monitoring.

INDIVIDUALS
IND630 – Georgia Haverty

Individual Comments

IND630-1



Cultural resource surveys were conducted for all parcels for
which the Applicants had survey permission. A summary of
these surveys are included in section 4.10 of the EIS.

INDIVIDUALS
IND630 – Georgia Haverty

Individual Comments

IND630-2

Statements regarding surveyors is noted. Waterbody, wetlands,
cultural resources, and threatened and endangered species
surveys should be conducted on all properties that would be
impacted by construction.

IND630-3



Under the NGA, the Commission authorizes natural gas
infrastructure, so that the public has access to natural gas
throughout the country.

INDIVIDUALS
IND630 – Georgia Haverty

Individual Comments

IND630-4



See the response to comment FA11-12 regarding need.

INDIVIDUALS
IND630 – Georgia Haverty

Individual Comments

IND630-5

While the snail darter is federally threatened, it is only known to
occur in Tennessee, Georgia, and Alabama. It is not listed by
FWS or VDGIF as being present in Virginia; nor is it noted in the
Virginia Wildlife Action Plan.

IND630-6

See the response to comment IND630-3 regarding surveys.IND630-7



See the response to comment IND152-1 regarding the FERC’s
third-party monitoring program.

INDIVIDUALS
IND630 – Georgia Haverty

Individual Comments

IND630-8



See the response to comment LA5-1 regarding stakeholder
comments.

INDIVIDUALS
IND630 – Georgia Haverty

Individual Comments

IND630-9

The work performance of all federal employees are evaluated.IND630-10



Steep slopes and landslides are addressed in section 4.1 of the
EIS. See the response to comment LA1-4 regarding existing 42-
inch-diamter pipelines in mountainous terrain. A revised
discussion of flash flooding is provided in section 4.3.2 of the
final EIS. See the response to comment IND70-1 regarding
erosions.

INDIVIDUALS
IND631 – Sam Kessler

Individual Comments

IND631-1



See the response to comment FA11-12 regarding need. See the
response to comment IND2-3 regarding export. See the response
to comment IND1-3 regarding eminent domain.

INDIVIDUALS
IND632 – Lynn Davis

Individual Comments

IND632-1

The EIS provides a discussion of sinkholes in section 4.1. See
the response to comment IND70-1 regarding erosion.

IND632-2



See the response to comment IND12-1 regarding property values.

INDIVIDUALS
IND633 – James R. Thomas

Individual Comments

IND633-1

See the response to comment IND2-1 regarding safety.IND633-2

Comments noted. See the response to comment IND281-2
regarding jobs in Virginia. See the response to comment
IND345-4 regarding taxes in Virginia.

IND633-3

We conclude that with mitigation, the project is not likely to have
significant impacts on most environmental resources (except
forest). The right-of-way would be restored and revegetated
following construction (see section 2.4.2 of the EIS).

IND633-4



See the response to comment FA15-10 regarding lifecycle
emissions.

INDIVIDUALS
IND634 – Pat Curran Leonard

Individual Comments

IND634-1



See the response to comment IND1-3 regarding eminent domain.

INDIVIDUALS
IND635 – Robert Pierson

Individual Comments

IND635-1



As stated in section 1.3.2 of the EIS, Mountain Valley would be
required to obtain a permit from the COE to cross wetlands.
Table 1.5-1 provides a list of major federal and state permits for
both projects.

INDIVIDUALS
IND636 – Pat Curran Leonard

Individual Comments

IND636-1



The EIS provides a discussion of sinkholes in section 4.1.

INDIVIDUALS
IND637 – Roberta Toney

Individual Comments

IND637-1

Water resources are discussed in section 4.3 of the EIS. See the
response to comment IND3-1 regarding drinking water.

IND637-2



The EIS provides a discussion of the Jefferson National Forest in
section 4.8 and waterbody crossings in section 4.3. Renewable
energy alternatives are discussed in section 3 of the EIS. See also
the response to comment IND40-1 regarding renewable energy.

INDIVIDUALS
IND638 – Laura Dent

Individual Comments

IND638-1



Visual impacts are addressed in section 4.8 and tourism in section
4.9 of the EIS.

INDIVIDUALS
IND639 – Sarah Waldrop

Individual Comments

IND639-1

See the response to comment IND2-1 regarding safety. The EIS
provides a discussion of water resources in section 4.3 and
wildlife in section 4.5.

IND639-2

Tourism is discussed in section 4.9.IND639-3



Climate change is addressed in sections 4.11 and 4.13 of the EIS.
It is unclear how the projects would spread lyme disease, result in
lengthier asthma and allergy seasons, create weather that would
harm crops, and result in rising sea levels.

INDIVIDUALS
IND640 – Victor Escobar

Individual Comments

IND640-1

The FS said that the MVP could not meet certain standards in the
LRMP as worded; however, the project design features,
mitigation measures and monitoring procedures were developed
with Mountain Valley to minimize the impacts to the resources
those standards were designed to protect.

IND640-2

See the response to comment FA8-1 regarding the 500-foot-wide
utility corridor in the Jefferson National Forest.

IND640-3

See the response to comment IND281-2 regarding jobs in
Virginia. See the response to comment IND345-4 regarding
taxes in Virginia. See the response to comment FA11-12
regarding need. Section 3.3 of the EIS provides a discussion of
using existing infrastructure as an alternative to the projects.

IND640-4



The Roadless Area Conservation Rule and impacts to roadless
areas under this regulation are discussed in section 4.8 of the EIS.
The mitigation measures, monitoring procedures, and reducing
the permanent operational right-of-way that is converted to
herbaceous cover from 50 feet wide to 10 feet wide are designed
to minimize the effects to the inventoried roadless area..

INDIVIDUALS
IND641 – Katie Jackson

Individual Comments

IND641-1

The EIS provides a discussion of wildlife in section 4.5 and
groundwater in section 4.3. See the response to comment IND3-
1 regarding drinking water. See the response to comment IND2-
1 regarding safety.

IND641-2

Socioeconomics are addressed in section 4.9 of the EIS. The
ANST crossing is discussed in section 4.8 of the EIS.

IND641-3



See the response to comment FA11-2 and LA5-1 regarding
preparation of the EIS. The visual impacts analysis regarding the
ANST has been revised in the final EIS. Tourism is discussed in
section 4.9 of the EIS.

INDIVIDUALS
IND642 – Paula Bittinger

Individual Comments

IND642-1

The FS has worked with Mountain Valley to develop project
design features, mitigation measures and monitoring procedures
to minimize the impacts to the resources those standards were
designed to protect.

IND642-2

Wetlands as delineated during surveys are discussed in section
4.3 of the EIS. Bottom Creek and paralleling waterbodies within
15 feet are discussed in section 4.3 of the EIS.

IND642-3



See the response to comment IND3-1 regarding drinking water.
See the response to comment CO14-1 regarding blasting. See the
response to comment IND70-1 regarding erosion.

INDIVIDUALS
IND642 – Paula Bittinger

Individual Comments

IND642-4

See the response to comment FA11-12 regarding need. See the
response to comment FA11-3 regarding a Programmatic EIS.

IND642-5



Comment noted.

INDIVIDUALS
IND643 – Kenneth J. Srpan

Individual Comments

IND643-1



Project-related impacts to the Jefferson National Forest are
discussed throughout the EIS.

INDIVIDUALS
IND644 – Michelle Williams

Individual Comments

IND644-1

GHGs and climate change are discussed in sections 4.11 and 4.13
of the EIS.

IND644-2



Project-related impacts on the Jefferson National Forest are
discussed throughout the EIS.

INDIVIDUALS
IND645 – Tobie Baldwin

Individual Comments

IND645-1



The visual impacts analysis regarding the ANST has been revised
in the final EIS. As stated in section 2.7 of the EIS, the useful
life of the projects is expected to be about 50 years.

INDIVIDUALS
IND646 – Henry Trease

Individual Comments

IND646-1

Forest fragmentation is discussed in section 4.4 of the EIS. See
the response to comment FA15-5 regarding forest impacts.

IND646-2

See the response to comment IND241-1 regarding induced
development.

IND646-3



See the response to comment FA11-2 and LA5-1 regarding
preparation of the EIS. See the response to comment FA8-1
regarding the 500-foot-wide utility corridor in the Jefferson
National Forest.

INDIVIDUALS
IND647 – Marjorie Lewter

Individual Comments

IND647-1

The EIS provides a discussion of the Jefferson National Forest in
section 4.8 and steep slopes in section 4.1. Forest fragmentation
and invasive species are discussed in section 4.4.

IND647-2

Water resources, including aquifers, are addressed in section 4.3
of the EIS.

IND647-3

See the response to comment IND70-1 regarding erosion. A
revised discussion of sedimentation and turbidity can be found in
section 4.3 of the EIS. A revised discussion of flash flooding is
provided in section 4.3.2 of the final EIS.

IND647-4

Invasive species are addressed in section 4.4 of the EIS. See the
response to comment LA1-7 regarding herbicides.

IND647-5

See the response to comment IND28-3 regarding financial
responsibility. See the response to comment IND3-1 regarding
drinking water.

IND647-6



See the response to comment FA11-2 and LA5-1 regarding
preparation of the EIS. Invasive species are discussed in section
4.4 of the EIS. The Preserve Craig’s letter is addressed in
comment CO53.

INDIVIDUALS
IND647 – Marjorie Lewter

Individual Comments

IND647-7

See the response to comment IND70-1 regarding erosion. See
the response to comment FA11-15 regarding sediment and
turbidity modeling.

IND647-8

IND647-9

IND647-10

Mr. Bouldin’s letters are addressed in comments IND87,
IND119, IND136, IND149, IND276, IND292, IND301, IND321,
IND466, IND513, IND550, IND660, IND727, IND826, and
IND851.

IND647-11

The Blue Ridge Land Conservancy letters is addressed in
comment CO6.

IND647-12

Preserve Craig letters are addressed in comments CO15, CO52,
CO53, CO55, CO56, CO57, CO64, and CO85. Cultural
attachment is discussed in section 4.10 of the EIS.

IND647-13

See the response to comment IND137-1 regarding the KeyLog
report.

IND647-14

See the response to comment FA11-8 regarding the FMP.IND647-15

See the response to comment FA11-12 regarding need. See the
response to comment LA1-4 regarding existing 42-inch-diameter
natural gas pipelines.

IND647-16

We conclude that with mitigation, the project is not likely to have
significant impacts on most environmental resources (except
forest). The right-of-way would be restored and revegetated
following construction (see section 2.4.2 of the EIS). The EIS
provides a discussion of steep slopes and seismic areas in section
4.1, water resources in section 4.3, vegetation in section 4.4, and
wildlife in section 4.5.

IND647-17

Mr. Johnson’s letter is addressed in comment IND498.

See the response to comment IND62-1 regarding Dr. Kastning’s
report.



INDIVIDUALS
IND647 – Marjorie Lewter

Individual Comments



As requested by the FERC, Mountain Valley filed a response to
the commentor’s letter on February 17, 2017 (Geology 11
Accession number 20170217-5199). Section 4.1 of the EIS has
been revised to provide a discussion of LiDAR, fracture trace
analyses, and electrical resistivity studies conducted by Mountain
Valley.

INDIVIDUALS
IND648 – Pamela L. Ferrante

Individual Comments

IND648-1



INDIVIDUALS
IND648 – Pamela L. Ferrante

Individual Comments



INDIVIDUALS
IND648 – Pamela L. Ferrante

Individual Comments



INDIVIDUALS
IND648 – Pamela L. Ferrante

Individual Comments

IND648-2 Section 4.1 provides a discussion of dye traces, fracture trace-
lineament analysis, and Mount Tabor.  Section 4.3 provides a 
discussion of the Red Sulphur PSD.



Section 4.1 has been revised to provide a discussion of the 
fracture trace-lineament analysis for the Mount Tabor Variation. 

INDIVIDUALS
IND648 – Pamela L. Ferrante

Individual Comments

IND648-3

Section 3.5 has been revised to include an evaluation of the 
Mount Tabor Variation. 

IND648-4



INDIVIDUALS
IND648 – Pamela L. Ferrante

Individual Comments



INDIVIDUALS
IND649 – Linda Parsons Sink

Individual Comments

See the response to CO6-1 regarding the Mount Tabor Variation.
See the response to CO34-1 regarding hydrogeological studies.

IND649-1



INDIVIDUALS
IND650 – Jobyl A. Boone

Individual Comments

See the response to comment FA11-12 regarding need.IND650-1



INDIVIDUALS
IND650 – Jobyl A. Boone

Individual Comments

See the response to comment IND281-2 regarding jobs in
Virginia. See the response to comment IND2-3 regarding export.

IND650-2

See the response to comment IND2-1 regarding safety.
.

IND650-3

The final EIS discusses potential impacts on Smith Mountain
Lake in section 4.3 and 4.8. See the response to comment IND3-
1 regarding drinking water. See the response to comment
IND70-1 regarding erosion. See the response to comment
IND92-1 regarding leaks. As stated in section 2.4 of the EIS the
pipeline would be buried beneath the streambed.

IND650-4
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